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With a quorum present, the Committee on Legislation was called to order at 
2:45 p.m.  
 
Chairman Nonna began the discussion on the Right to First Refusal law, 
which currently allows the County to sell property to municipalities for $1 as 
long as the property is used for a park or municipal purposes.  
 
Betsy DeSoye, Committee Counsel to the Committee on Legislation, 
presented the history of the Right to First Refusal Law, the current 
affordable housing settlement, and how it requires the County to change 
the Right to First Refusal Law to remove that right when the County is 
selling the property for fair and affordable housing.  
 
A discussion ensued regarding the wording of the amended law.  
 
The Chairman asked the County Attorney’s office, with the agreement of 
the Committee, to strike the proposed changes to Section 1 Subdivision “2” 
of Section 104.11; under Section 2 Subdivision “8” of Section 209.101 to 
strike the proposed addition of a sub-section “b”, and in that proposed 
section the additional wording “but not limited to: (1)”; the addition of a 
proposed sub-section (2); to change the proposed sub-section “c” to “b” and 
strike the first word “No” and adds the word not so the sentence reads: 
“Real property of the county which is no longer required for any county 
purpose may not be sold…”  



The Chairman also asked the County Attorney with the agreement of the 
Committee to strike all additional language under the same sub-section “b” 
[(6)]; to change section to (2) to sub-section [(7)], and to change the 
wording in [(7)] to read: “Notwithstanding the foregoing real property which 
is to be sold and or transferred for the primary purpose of providing fair and 
affordable housing.” 
 
Moved by Legislator Burton seconded by Legislator Pinto the Committee 
minutes of January 11, 2010 were approved with a vote of 9-0. 
 
Moved by Legislator Burton seconded by Legislator Pinto the Committee 
minutes of January 19, 2010 were approved with a vote of 9-0. 
 
Moved by Legislator Maisano seconded by Legislator Pinto the Committee 
on Legislation adjourned at 4:20 p.m. with a vote of 9-0. 
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